
Gym Matts for P&R programs

14-28 , closed 02/21/14 @ 11am

 

       6' x 42 "

Mats   7 Mats Porta track 15 Ft 12' x 12"

Total Price Sub Price Ea / total Freight Sub price Porta track Landing Mat Freight

Deary's Gym Supply 10,612.50$   5,517.50$   4,476.50$  1,041.00$  5,095.00$      3,495.00$    1,295.00$      305.00$    

Danielson, CT ea. 639.50$      

Del Date = 2-3 weeks

Products Unlimited 11,105.00$   5,523.00$   4,473.00$  1,050.00$  5,582.00$      3,639.00$    1,423.00$      520.00$    

Justin,TX ea. 639.00$     

Del Date = 2-4 wks

Hinding Tennis Courts 11,600.00$   6,285.00$   5,285.00$  1,000.00$  5,315.00$      3,785.00$    1,030.00$      500.00$    

West Haven, CT ea. 755.00$     

Del Date = 3-4 weeks

AD Mats Corp 6,178.34$     4,846.80$   3,817.80$  1,029.00$  1,331.54$      -$             947.75$         383.79$    

Boynton Beach, Fl 6,273.34$     ea. 545.40$     No Bid

Del Date = 2-3 weeks w/tailgate del.

BSN Sports 6,974.26$     5,488.44$   5,190.01$  298.43$     1,485.82$      -$             1,187.39$      298.43$    

Dreshcer, PA ea. 741.43$     No Bid

Del Date =

Gopher 8,582.80$     7,035.94$   6,514.76$  521.18$     1,546.86$      -$             1,432.28$      114.58$    

Owatonna, Mn ea. 930.68$     No Bid

Del Date = 10-20 days

Cannon Sports Inc.,  No Bid

No judgment as to responsiveness of bid as of this posting

No judgment as to the responsibility of the bidder as of this posting

Jerry Gay, C.P.P.B.

Town of Ridgefield


